REGISTERED No. M-302

S
B 2 of Pakistan
npagst

EXTRAORDINARY

The Gazefte

PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

KARACHI, MONDAY, JANUARY 11, 2010

PART i

Statutory Notifications containing Rules and Orders issued by all
Ministries and Divislons of the Government of Pakistan and
their Attached and Subordinate Offices and the
Supreme Court of Pakiatan

GOVERNMENT OF PAKISTAN
MINISTRY OF HEALTH
NOTIFICATIONS

{slamabad, the 21st December, 2009

$.R.0. 01 (KE)/2010:

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 8 of the Cigarettes (Printing
of Waming) Ordinance, 1879 (LXXIII of 1979), the Federal Government is
pleased to direct that the following amendments shall be made in the sald Rules,

namely:-
In the aforesald Rules,-

(a) In-rule, 1, In sub-rule (2), for the words "1st day of February", the words
“31st day of May" shall be substituted;

(b) rule 5 shall be re-numbered as sub-rule (1) of that rule and after sub-
rule (1), re-numbered as aforesaid, the following new sub-rule shall be
added, namely:- .

(01)
Price : Rs. 2.00



2 THE GAZETTE OF PAKISTAN, EXTRA., JANUARY, 11, 2010 [ParT I

"(2) Not with standing anything contained in rule 9, for the purposes of warn-
ing prescribed under the rule 2 of the Cigarettes (Printing of Warning)
Rules, 2003, in the firat Instance there shall be a grace period of ninety
days starting from 31st May, 2010, to clear from the factory premises
and port of entry containers of clgarettes bearing the health warning
prescribed for the expired rotational peried."; and (¢) in rule 7, in
sub-rule (2), for the word "top", the words "centre of the" shall be
substituted.

8.R.0. 02 (KE)/2010;

In exercise of the powers conferred by section 3 of the Cigarettes (Printing
of Warning) Ordinance, 1979 {LXXIIl of 1879), the Ministry of Health is pleased to
diract that the following amendments shall be made in its Notification No. 5.R.0O.
87/(KE)/2008, dated the 23rd October, namely:-

In the aforesaid Notlfication,-

(&) In clause, (1), for the words "1st day of February”, the words "31st day
of May" shall be substituted; and '

{(b) in clause (2}, after the word "printed", the words and commas”, "as far
as possible," shall be ingserted.

No. F.2-76/2007-FCTC(Pt).

MUHAMMAD IQBAL,
Daputy Secretary (Admn.).

PRINTED BY THE MANAGER, PRINTING CORPORATION OF PAKISTAN PRESS, KARACHI
PUBLIBHED BY THE DEPUTY CONTROLLER, STATIONERY AND FORMS, KARACHI.



